
   Presque Isle County Road Commission
Minutes
April 17, 2019
The regular meeting of the Board of Road Commissioners for Presque Isle County was held at the Road Commission office at 657 South Bradley, Rogers City, Michigan. Chairman Thomas Catalano called the meeting to order at 8:30 a.m.  
Board Members Present:  Ronald Bischer, Thomas Catalano, Stephen Lang
Also Present:  Supt./Mgr Gerald Smigelski, Clerk Anne Wirgau
Visitors:   Richard Nash, Allis Township Supervisor; John Chappa, Presque Isle County Commissioner
Minutes:

          A motion was made by Lang (Bischer) to approve minutes from April 3, 2019 
 meeting as presented. 

         Ayes:  All

Accounts Payable: 
           Motion by Bischer (Lang) to approve the April 17, 2019 accounts payable in the amount of $80,366.23
         Ayes:    Catalano, Bischer, Lang
Supt./Mgr Report: 

· Keith Konieczny has been appointed the new Rogers City Foreman.  In addition to Keith the Supt./Mgr and Foremen also interviewed Russell Martin for the position.  It was determined that Keith was the best candidate for the position.  Russ has agreed to be an acting Foreman when Keith is on vacation.  Will discuss salary recommendation in new business.  Keith will have to take Reasonable Suspicion and Soil Erosion Training this summer.
· Supt./Mgr attended the Rural Task Force meeting last Friday at Montmorency County Road Commission, our MDOT planning person apologized for the error on our 451 project.  Project is now obligated and scheduled for a June letting date.  We have changed the completion date and still have the authority to reject bids if we don’t like them.  Money will stay will us until the project is completed.

· The MDOT 5 year plan map was reviewed.

· North Allis Township has contacted me regarding their approval of a chip seal project on Bonz Beach Highway.  A Township agreement has been sent out.  They requested payment over three years and Supt./Mgr okayed, small amount.  
· Ocqueoc Township has requested we expand the shoulder of Ocqueoc Road next to the transfer station to allow for additional parking.  It is a one day project they will pay for totally.

· The new CAT loader is scheduled to be here in early September.

· Supt./Mgr will be meeting with representatives from Huron Engineering, Huron Pines and U.S. Fish & Wildlife at the Three Mile Hwy culvert project later today to discuss concerns  regarding the culvert height and erosion.

· MDOT has given us a TWA to operate a feller buncher along M-65 and US-23 north.  Will be removing trees/brush within right of way for approximately a month.

· We received anywhere from 1” to 6” of snow on Sunday evening.  More snow on the southern and eastern end of the county.  Crews have been blading up the gravel roads whenever possible.  Frost is leaving the roads, possibly looking towards end of the month to lift spring weight restrictions.

· Boardroom replacement chairs – looking to update as the current chairs are over 30 years old.  Estimated cost for eight chairs, $2,100.   Commissioner Bischer is not in favor of getting new chairs.

· Sarah Melching is the newly hired  Presque Isle County Emergency Services Coordinator taking over for John Kasuba.

· Will be replacing culverts on project roads soon to allow them time to settle down prior to reconstruction.
· Supt./Mgr has been discussing with DNR culvert issues on the rails to trails system.  Several failing culverts are causing water to be held back, thus affecting West Metz highway.  DNR could possibly want to contract with us to replace the bad culverts.

· Supt./Mgr is getting a list of roads from the Foremen to have a contractor come in to do crack sealing.  Looking at recently paved roads, both local and primary that we would have this done on.  Approximate cost of between $10,000 to $15,000.

· An estimate to replace the carpeting in the employee’s lunchroom/meeting room is being sought.  The plan is to install a tile floor for ease of cleaning and will also be adding some type of sound absorbing barrier to reduce the echo.

· Supt./Mgr is scheduled to have knee replacement surgery done April 25, 2019.  The first scheduled appointment for Dr checkup after the surgery is May 13, 2019.  Supt./Mgr will be off work until then, missing the first meeting in May.  Will be available by phone and email for questions from the office.
9:00 a.m. – Seasonal Items Bid Opening

[image: image1.emf]Vendor

Haul Location Price per Ton

Goodrich Trucking

Onaway 7.50 $                       

Posen 4.50 $                       

Rogers City 4.75 $                       

Metz 4.75 $                       

Grand Lake

3.75 $                       

R/T Trucking

Onaway 5.82 $                       

Posen 3.26 $                       

Rogers City 4.48 $                       

Metz 3.26 $                       

Grand Lake 2.48 $                       

Alpena Aggregate

Onaway 6.50 $                       

Posen 4.55 $                       

Rogers City 4.55 $                       

Metz 5.35 $                       

Grand Lake 5.21 $                         

2019

       Bid Opening

Hauling Aggregate Stone - 29A


    A motion was made by Bischer (Lang) to award bid to low bidder R/T Trucking.
    Ayes:  Lang, Bischer, Catalano
[image: image2.emf]Vendor Spread Delivered

per gallon per gallon

Michigan Chloride no bid no bid

Liquid Calcium 0.6370 $                 

 

no bid

35% Liquid Calcium Chloride

Northern A-1 Services 0.2150 $                 

 

0.2050 $                        

2019

   Dust & Ice Control Brine 


     A motion was made by Lang (Catalano) to accept and award the bid to Northern A-1.
     Ayes:  Catalano, Lang

     Nays:  Bischer

[image: image3.emf]2019

Vendor CP-6 CP-7

per Ton per Ton

Rieth-Riley no bid pickup $102.00

delivered $112.50

Unique Paving no bid pickup $89.00

    -  UPM

delivered $115.84

Goodrich no bid pickup $94.00

 - QPR

delivered $98.00

            Bituminous Cold Patch

       Bid Opening


     A motion was made by Bischer (Lang) to accept all bids and allow Supt./Mgr to purchase in the best interest of the Road Commission.
     Ayes:  Catalano, Bischer, Lang

[image: image4.emf]Vendor: Bit-Mat Michigan Paving Asphalt Materials

HFRS-2   $1.9400 $2.2000 $2.0000

MS2H  

MSOP

 

HFRS-2M $2.2500 $2.5000 $2.4000

RS-2A

AE-90 $1.9400 $2.8800 $2.0000

SS1H no bid no bid $2.2000

PEP

 

CQSEA Fog

OTHER TS-sp $1.6500

TS-wp

AEP-B

Demurrage  $100 per hour $100 per hour $110 per hour

STAND BY TIME 3 hrs 2 hrs 2 Hrs

Minimum Shipment 9000 9000/5000/1500 5500 gallons

HFRS-2/CQSEA/AMS

Terms net 30 net 30 net 30

**all prices are per gallon

2019

Bid Opening

Asphalt Emulsions


     A motion was made by Lang (Catalano) to accept all bids and allow Supt./Mgr to purchase in the best interest of the Road Commission.

     Ayes:  Lang, Bischer, Catalano

Unfinished Business:

         None
 New Business:

        Clerk Wirgau and Supt./Mgr Smigelski reviewed the 2018 Financial Audit and Act 51 Report with the Board.  Discussion was held.  Total revenue for 2018 was $7,032,824 million and expenditures were $6,365,098 million resulting in a net increase in fund balance of $667,726.  No exceptions or problems were encountered during the audit.
         A motion was made by Lang (Bischer) to accept the 2018 Financial Audit and Act 51 Report and to authorize Chairman to sign the Act 51attest sheet.

        Ayes:  Catalano, Bischer, Lang
        A motion was made by Lang (Bischer) to authorize expenses for Commissioners to attend the Straits Area Council Meeting on Tuesday, May 7, 2019 at Mackinac City.

       Ayes:  Lang, Bischer, Catalano
      Discussion was held regarding the setting of salary for newly promoted Rogers City Foreman Keith Konieczny.  A motion was made by Lang (Bischer) to set Keith Konieczny’s 2019 salary at $46,500.00 and to review at year end for 2020.
       Ayes:  Catalano, Bischer, Lang
      A motion was made by Lang (Bischer) to authorize Keith Konieczny to use the Awakon VISA account #13627-860 and to remove Donald Roznowski from the account.

     Ayes:  Lang, Bischer, Catalano
    A motion was made by Bischer (Lang) to sign title sheet to chip seal 3.5 miles of 634 Hwy (451 Hwy east 2.5 miles and ½ mile west of Co Rd 441 and ½ mile east of Co Rd 441) under Force Account work.
   Ayes:  Catalano, Lang, Bischer
    The revised County Road Association Constitution and Bylaws were given to Commissioners for review and discussion.  Will bring to vote at next meeting.
     After discussion, a motion was made by Lang (Bischer) to advertise for bids for the Rogers City Salt Shed Roof Replacement with bid opening to be held Wednesday, May 22, 2019.
     Ayes:  Lang, Bischer, Catalano
    A motion was made by Bischer (Lang) to enter an agreement with Allis Township to chip seal 638 Hwy between Belding and Glasier Roads with an approximate cost of $27,000.00.  Allis Township cost share will be $17,550.00.
    Ayes:  Bischer, Catalano, Lang

  Chairman Catalano set the May meeting dates of Wednesday, May 1, 2019 at 8:30 a.m. and Wednesday, May 22, 2019 at 8:30 a.m.

   A motion was made by Lang (Bischer) to adjourn at 11:29 a.m.


